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• Simplifies sharing code.

• It stores over two million code repositories.

• It is used by more than one million people..

• It is the largest code host storer in the world.



• Developers can create projects on behalf of 
their organization, or only have readability 
access to projects.

• Read-only, read- write and administration-
level access.

• No limits on numbers of teams on a project or 
numbers of members on each team.



• Shared Administration.

• Administrators who oversee your groups’ 
billing information and/or who oversee team 
management can work together using their 
Git Hub accounts.



• Open Source is free and it offers unlimited 
repositories and public collaborations.

• There are various financial plans available, 
ranging from seven dollars monthly to two 
hundred dollars monthly.



• GitHub originated in San Francisco; various 
social media includes a blog; Twitter feeds and 
Flickr.

• Meet-ups are also arranged throughout the 
year so  users can get to know each other and 
also beer parties are featured through the 
organization.



• Gollum Wikis.

• Gollum is an open source wiki engine created 
by GitHub. It is backed by Git, clonable, usable 
offline, and accepts many text formats. 

• Every wiki is a Git repository and wikis also can 
be cloned .  The content, images and history 
will stay the same.

• Wikis are importable and exportable by 
default.  


